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October 27,2010

South Dakota Public Utilities Commission
500 East Capitol Avenue
Pierre, SD 57501-5070

RE: Closing of Account

Dear Sir or Madam:

RECEIVED
NOV 012010

SOUTH DAKOTA PUBLIC
UTILITIES COMMISSION

Please close the account for Coast International, Inc. as we are no longer doing business in the state of South
Dakota.

If you have any further questions, I can be contacted at 913-859-9000 ext 826.

Thank you,

;;tv-
Lisa Soetaert e'f-o 'l.;l.. ""
Accounting
Coast International, Inc.
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----Original Message----- 
From: Lisa Soetaert  
Sent: Thursday, November 04, 2010 8:39 AM 
To: Kemnitz, Cindy 
Subject: RE: Gross Receipt Tax invoice for CY2009 and CY2010 
 
Cindy, 
 
We will get payment in the mail tomorrow for the $250 for 2009.  Can you please verify 
the address to remit the payment to? 
 
SD PUC 
500 E Capitol Ave 
Pierre, SD 57501-5070 
 
Thank you, 
 
Lisa Soetaert 
Coast International, Inc. 
913-859-9000 ext 826 
913-859-9805 fax 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Cindy Kemnitz 
Sent: Thursday, November 04, 2010 7:31 AM 
To: Lisa Soetaert 
Subject: RE: Gross Receipt Tax invoice for CY2009 and CY2010 
 
We can do that. 
 
Thanks! 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Lisa Soetaert  
Sent: Wednesday, November 03, 2010 3:55 PM 
To: Kemnitz, Cindy 
Subject: RE: Gross Receipt Tax invoice for CY2009 and CY2010 
 
Cindy, 
 
If we pay the invoice for 2009 can we get the invoice for 2010 written off? We have not 
done business in South Dakota since October 2008 and our authority has already been 
revoked (see attached letter). 
 
Thank you, 
 
Lisa Soetaert 
Coast International, Inc. 
913-859-9000 ext 826 
913-859-9805 fax 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Cindy Kemnitz 
Sent: Monday, November 01, 2010 1:29 PM 
To: Lisa Soetaert 
Cc: Karen Cremer 
Subject: Gross Receipt Tax invoice for CY2009 and CY2010 
 
Lisa, 
 
Attached is the invoice for Coast International, Inc, gross receipt tax assessment for 
calendar year 2009 and 2010.  Upon remittance of this payment, the South Dakota Public 



Utilities Commission will withdraw your certificate of authority.  Please let me know 
if you have any questions. 
 
Thanks! 
 
 
 
 


