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RE: RM.05-002 
Written Comments on Potential Revisions to the Commission's Switched Access Rules 
Codified in ARSD 20: 1 O:27 through 20: 1 O:29 

Dear Ms. Van Gerpen: . 

MCImetro Access Transmission Services, LLC dba Verizon Access Transmission Services and 
MCI Communications Services, Inc. dba Verizon Business (hereinafter referred to collectively as 
"Verizon Business") submit these initial comments regarding potential revisions to the 
Commission's Switched Access Rules codified in ARSD 20:10:27 through 20: lO:29. 

Verizon Business will likely file more detailed comments with the Commission and otherwise 
actively participate in this docket. Verizon Business operates as both a local exchange carrier 
and interexchange carrier, providing services in South Dakota. Verizon Business and its 
customers have a direct interest in the outcome of this rule making docket. As a local exchange 
carrier and long distance provider, Verizon Business is subject to the payment of switched access 
charges in order to provide its customers services in the state, md the level of those payments 
can affect the prices Verizon Business charges its customers. The prescribed manner in which 
intrastate access rates are set directly affects the cost of toll services provided to and paid by the 
customers of Verizon Business and the public in the State of South Dakota. 

Since the current rules were written, both intramodal and intennodal competition has grow 
substantially in South Dakota. The Federal Communications Commission is also reviewing 
intercarrier compensation at this time and has recognized that the rates for switched access 
service must be reviewed in view of extensive competition and varying rates paid for eq~~ivalent 
wholesale services by providers using different technologies. 
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The rules as they exist have resulted in very high instate switched access rates for many of South 
Dakota's independent rural telephone companies, whose rates generally significantly exceed the 
rates charged for the same services provided by Qwest Corporation. 

Accordingly, MCImetro Access Transmission Services, LLC dba Verizon Access Transmission 
Services and MCI Communications Services, Inc. dba Verizon Business advise the Commission 
that they will participate, and reserve the right to file future comments, reply comments, and 
otherwise actively participate in this docket. 

Very truly yours, 

MAY, A&IAM, GERDES & THOMPSON LLP 

BRETT KOENECKE 


